
LETTER TO U.S. PROBATION OFFICE REQUESTING AND/OR
SUGGESTING BRIAN DAVID HILL BE A CANDIDATE FOR EARLY
RELEASE/EARLY TERMINATION FROM SUPERVISED RELEASE

Monday, May 13, 2024 - 12:33 AM

ATTN: Jennifer K. Williams, Chief 
Probation Officer, U.S. Probation Office
210 Franklin Road S.W.
Room 402
Roanoke, VA 24011

Phone: 540-857-5180

I, Brian David Hill, am requesting from the chief U.S. Probation Officer, to 
consider me a candidate for early termination/early release from supervised release for 
the following facts and reasons I am stating under penalty of perjury. I believe I am 
giving good reasons and good facts as to why my supervised release should be early 
terminated. Here they are:

(1) I have autism spectrum disorder, obsessive compulsive disorder, generalized 
anxiety disorder, type one brittle diabetes (also known as uncontrollable diabetes), 
gastrointestinal issues which means that I take probiotics. I am disabled living off of SSI
disability from the Social Security Administration, and living on a Medicaid waiver by 
Virginia Department of Health and Human Services for a caretaker program to help take 
care of my needs on a day to day basis. I have never been charged with any violent 
crime.

(2) I am not a danger to the community because I have never raped, I have never 
molested, I have never groomed anybody for any sexual reason, I have never committed 
arson, I have never shoplifted, I have never murdered, I have never been charged with 
assault, I have never victimized anybody as nobody has ever accused me of victimizing 
them, nobody. I have no victims. Even the U.S. Probation Office has the evidence that I 
have been approved over a total of 10-20 or more requests to travel including both day 
trips and multi-day travel. A majority of those approvals were under Senior U.S. 
Probation Officer Jason McMurray. It will take me time to look though my records to 
compile a list of every approval from Mr. McMurray for every day travel approval. I 
have been approved for requests to travel for a lot of different places. If theoretically I 
was a danger to the community, these approvals never would have been granted or I 
would have been more restricted. My family has researched these emails to assist me in 
giving you the DATA proving my claims. My Probation Officer/Officers have approved 
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these requests to travel:
(1) Email from Jason McMurray to my mother 

(rbhill67@yahoo.com) dated Sun, Jul 16, 2023 at 3:41 PM said: “Absolutely. You may 
go visit him anytime. Hopefully he recovers very soon and comes home.” Note: That is 
a pretty good showing of trust to grant that kind of approval for travel for a granddad in 
the hospital before he was deceased last year. Shows how safe Brian is for the 
community to grant this kind of approval to travel.

(2) Email from Jason McMurray to my mother 
(rbhill67@yahoo.com) dated Fri, Sep 29, 2017 at 7:47 PM said: “Yes that will be fine. I 
have been in court all week, even after hours, for a jury trial. Sorry I missed his call.”

(3) Also received permission to travel to North Carolina to see the 
Solar Eclipse on August 21, 2017.

(4) A lot of requests to travel were done over telephone for the day 
trips. I am sure every approved travel is in my file somewhere.

(5) I do have records somewhere of my phone call caused day-travel 
approvals for my requests to travel, the approvals from Mr. McMurray but it will take 
time to compile those records and make a list of exactly how many approvals McMurray
gave me.

(3) My supervised release was normally supposed to have ended in November, 
2024. The reason it was extended was because of a supervised release violation charge 
in 2018 which came rather quickly without all the necessary evidence and information 
when information was severely limited. What I mean about that was Jason McMurray 
learned of me wandering at night to a walking trail then was found naked and saying it 
was a “black man in a hoodie” and that I was arrested for indecent exposure and was 
medically and psychologically cleared, making a quick summary about that. The charge 
came before more information came out years later. Information which would have 
altered the course of the supervised release violation possibly would not have ended up 
in a revocation.

(1) A new police chief in Martinsville was assigned last year in the 
city of Martinsville after the old corrupt police chief G. E Cassady left his post along 
with the resignation of Attorney Eric Monday who was the City Attorney for the city of 
Martinsville. Because of some corrupt actors in the Martinsville City Government had 
left office for whatever reason, Brian Hill was able to file a Freedom of Information Act 
(FOIA) request asking for the body-camera footage concerning the indecent exposure 
charge on September 21, 2018. A letter response by the City of Martinsville was given to
Roberta Hill by email indicating by Chief Rob Fincher that the body-camera footage 
was deleted/destroyed on April 9, 2019. Those two videos had existed, one was body-
camera by Officer Robert Jones, and the other was the police car camera concerning 
myself when I was questioned and arrested. That footage was never marked as evidence 
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by the Commonwealth's Attorney despite me being arrested, charged with indecent 
exposure, and the General District Court and the Circuit Court both filed court orders 
demanding the discovery materials be made available to the criminal defendant. It was 
the duty of the prosecutor to mark that as evidence. Court orders were ignored by the 
prosecutor, and that same prosecutor for my indecent exposure case never provided the 
body-camera footage to USPO Jason McMurray who was likely looking for answers by 
inquiring as to why I was out there naked. Yet he was never given access to this footage. 
That also should have been provided to the U.S. Probation Office and the U.S. Attorney 
who prosecuted me for the supervised release violation. They were never provided 
copies of this evidence before the evidence was illegally destroyed and not complied 
with two to three court orders for discovery material included any recorded statement 
defendant made to a law enforcement officer who encompasses body-camera footage. I 
did not have anything solid to prove the unlawful destruction of the body-camera 
footage to my federal Probation Officer Jason McMurray at the time until last year, and I
had my mother email Jason McMurray with the evidence. Email date: Tue, Feb 14, 2023
at 6:59 PM, subject: body-camera footage illegally destroyed in supervised release 
violation case; sent to jason_mcmurray@vawp.uscourts.gov, email from 
rbhill67@yahoo.com. That email reportedly has three attachments which can be 
examined by the U.S. Probation Office. This evidence was made known years after the 
revocation judgment was entered. This evidence was also brought up last year in the 
2255 case trying to get the supervised release revocation judgment in 2018 to be vacated
or set aside. The 2255 case is still pending without any resolution and nothing is 
happening. Jason was given enough evidence that the supervised release violation was 
possibly without merit. The body-camera footage would have shown involuntary 
intoxication at the time Brian Hill was found in the nude. Involuntary intoxication is a 
legal defense for indecent exposure but evidence of it was never presented to the judge 
because the Commonwealth's Attorney ignored the court orders and never marked the 
body-camera footage as evidence which is odd for an indecent exposure case. Why 
would the Commonwealth's Attorney destroy evidence unless it would be favorable to 
the federal probationer and criminal defendant??? That was why this evidence was 
emailed by my mother Roberta Hill to Jason McMurray, because evidence is evidence.

(2) Jason was emailed evidence that lab tests were ordered and then 
were deleted from the chart by Sovah Hospital in Martinsville formerly Martinsville 
Memorial Hospital. My grandmother noticed that even though the hospital has on record
that I am type 1 diabetic, they never checked my glucose levels that night. Officer Jones 
filed a completely false statement when he said I was medically and psychologically 
cleared. He said I was cleared but didn't know for a fact whether or not I was cleared by 
laboratory tests. I obtained the hospital medical records and it said deleted from the 
chart. So they don't even know whether I was intoxicated or not. I could have been in a 
garage with car fumes, or somebody could have grabbed me in the middle of the night 

Page 3 of 7 - Letter to Chief U.S. Probation Officer dated May 13, 2024.

mailto:rbhill67@yahoo.com
mailto:jason_mcmurray@vawp.uscourts.gov


and injected me with some drug. Nobody knows because the lab work was deleted from 
the chart. So I was not medically cleared and thus the supervised release violation was 
without merit in regard to me being medically cleared on September 21, 2018. The 
evidence disproves the essential element to my violation charge. This was also emailed 
to my USPO Jason McMurray at the time by my mother Roberta Hill. Email from 
rbhill67@yahoo.com, date: Tue, Aug 2, 2022 at 12:49 PM, Subject: Brian Hill monthly 
report, evidence not medically cleared; said: “Jason, Here is the monthly report.  Brian 
wanted for me to send you his letter, and proof that he was not medically cleared on 
September 21, 2018.” It was sent to jason_mcmurray@vawp.uscourts.gov. So the U.S. 
Probation Office has the evidence of the unlawful cover up of the police body-camera 
footage of what happened with me being arrested and found on September 21, 2018. 
Potential evidence of involuntary intoxication was illegally deleted even though three 
court orders exist in the record of my state criminal case which cannot vanish. These 
court orders asked for this evidence and the state prosecutor ignored those court orders 
and never marked it as evidence. Never informed the U.S. Attorney and never informed 
my Probation Officer of me being in the body-camera footage, never provided any 
copies to them. Then the lab tests were ordered and then deleted without explanation as 
to why they would just abruptly decide not to clear me from a intoxication standpoint. 
They did not clear me of anything regarding intoxication. So I can argue to any jury that 
they cannot claim I was not intoxicated because they never cleared me of that because 
the lab tests were DELETED from my medical chart on September 21, 2018, or 
whatever date they decided to cover that up. Two things which would have proven 
involuntary intoxication were covered up, and they were all emailed by my mother to 
Jason McMurray, my Probation Officer.

(3) It was a medical emergency that night on September 21, 2018. 
That incident was never repeated. Nothing prior to that. Nothing after that. It was a 
medical situation which got misconstrued as criminal activity when it is not and 
evidence was covered up (lab tests, body-camera footage) which is unusual for an 
indecent exposure situation. Usually these cover ups don't happen unless there is 
something to hide here, and it wasn't Brian Hill trying to cover up evidence but was the 
prosecution. The supervised release violation never should have been extended. It is 
clear that early termination is warranted here.

(4) Jason McMurray was emailed evidence by my grandparents 
Kenneth and Stella Forinash about me being exposed to carbon monoxide before I was 
arrested for indecent exposure and Jason has noticed issues with my behavior during the 
period of the carbon monoxide poisoning. In 2018, he had noticed significant and 
unexplained damage in my apartment on the wall and/or ceiling and had expressed 
concerns about this unexplained damage in my apartment not knowing that it was 
carbon monoxide caused damage. During two federal hearings (December, 2018 and 
May, 2019) regarding my indecent exposure in Roanoke federal courthouse in front of 
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U.S. Magistrate Robert S. Ballou, Jason did express concerns about my mental health 
and competency or sanity because my behavior went odd before my arrest were I had 
soap caked on my clothes and he thought something wasn't right. Talking about weird 
paranoid stuff like saying President and his family was going to be killed even though 
that did not happen. I was saying in the writing to the federal court that I saw somebody 
watching me in the thicket. That means he felt I may have been intoxicated by an 
unknown thing and it was by carbon monoxide gas. See the testimony from Pete 
Compton of ACE Chimney and Wildlife. You can look into the emails about carbon 
monoxide which were emailed to Jason McMurray. Then you have your evidence and 
the time that evidence was emailed to that Probation Officer.

(4) I have completed all necessary and required mental health services including 
counseling services throughout my supervision. This includes Hank Daniels of the 
National Counseling Group, Preston Page of Martinsville, Virginia, and Piedmont 
Community Services. Only one time was I required to do Radford Counseling but was 
discharged from the group because I had kept insisting that I was set up especially with 
what me and my family read in the discovery papers before it was destroyed by both the 
federal prosecutor and the court appointed attorney John Scott Coalter. Stella Forinash, 
Kenneth Forinash, Roberta Hill, and myself saw all of the discovery papers after I plead 
guilty. I felt that I had plead guilty only to technical possession of child porn but I did 
have access to proof I was set up. That proof was in the U.S. Attorney Office's discovery
evidence materials. My family and me took a photo of some pages and one of them said 
“454 files had been downloaded with the emule program between July 20, 2012, and 
July 28, 2013”. My computer was seized on August 28, 2012. So it continued 
downloading to my computer even after it was seized by law enforcement. I have given 
this fact even to Roger Stone asking for a full pardon from Donald Trump because I feel 
that I am innocent of child porn and had falsely pled guilty. Unfortunately because of the
January 6 riot at the U.S. Capitol building, there was no investigation and thus I was 
never given a full pardon despite my affidavit to The White House through Roger Stone. 
Anyways, this proves I did not cause the child porn to be there since it was downloading
even after my computer was seized. It was hacked and the download dates support this 
theory. The U.S. Attorney's own discovery forensic report from the NC State Bureau of 
Investigation under Robert V. White, special agent, Page IV. All of that was there. I 
simply brought the truth to Radford Counseling and was discharged from the group but 
Jason McMurray did not recommend revocation but for me to continue my supervision. 
I did know for a fact from the U.S. Attorney's own discovery evidence materials that the 
child porn case was a fraud. Like the PSI seems to point out that I have no victims. I 
read through the entire forensic report and there are no blurred thumbnails, no file lists 
of the suppose child porn. The PSI said NCMEC said not of a known series, which 
contradicts detective Robert Bridge saying these files were known to him of the ICAC 
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task force. So everything seems to contradict each other. My false confession contradicts
the very evidence in the discovery. So Radford Counseling couldn't counsel me since my
case has weird abnormalities which normally happens when somebody is being set up 
with fake evidence and is being set up with a crime. Usually these criminal set ups aren't
well planned out. Luckily in my case it wasn't well planned out to be a perfect set up 
against me. So I have completed all counseling, and I am still trying for a full pardon 
from Donald Trump and asking Donald Trump for an investigation into my child porn 
case because there is enough evidence that the child porn case is shoddy. I was just 
given a bad public defender who didn't want to take the time to actually investigate my 
guilt or innocence. The grand jury would indict a ham sandwich. Grand jury indictments
meaning nothing, heck they indicted Donald Trump. I got indicted because the grand 
jury never had access to the search warrant for seizing my computer which would 
conflict with the download dates and the jury would have scratched their heads in 
disbelief. The grand jury never saw the search warrant which would have shown the 
contradictions. When evidence contradicts each other, it is a shoddy case, it is not with 
merit, it is not a slam dunk.

(5) Despite the few incidents such as 2018 caused by carbon monoxide with lack 
of real medical clearing (no confirmed lab tests, unlawfully deleted body-camera footage
because the prosecutor refused to mark it as evidence and refused to give a copy to the 
U.S. Probation Office and never provided a copy to the U.S. Attorney), autism meltdown
in 2015 caused my stress, anxiety, high blood sugar. I believe I have exhibited good 
behavior here and have done the best that I can to comply with the conditions of my 
supervision. I have served a lot of years. My supervision had started in November 12, 
2014. I had completed my counseling for years and years straight to when Jason 
McMurray saw no need for it to continue. I believe I had served enough years of 
supervision because normally it would end this year. It got extended due to a revocation 
which was too quick and didn't take into the consideration the cover up of body-camera 
footage, the cover up of lab tests, the cover up of hard evidence (lab tests) that I was 
intoxicated by carbon monoxide poisoning.

It is clear I deserve early release and early termination of my federal supervised 
release. I hope by writing this letter, you will agree to my request and so I will not have 
to hire a lawyer and take this to Court to push for this early termination/early release. I 
want to see if you will simply agree to this after you investigate my claims and evidence 
submitted to the U.S. Probation Office by my family. Also it should be noted I am a 
virgin, never molested anybody, never groomed anybody, yet I am given more years of 
supervised release than Jeffrey Epstein who trafficked and groomed many underage girls
and pimped them out to politicians and celebrities. He got one year of probation. I got 
more years than Jeffrey. Jeffrey deserved more years than me. I am a virgin. Jeffrey 
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Epstein is more a danger to the community, and I am a guy with autism who was never 
charged with any violent offense. I never murdered. There is a clear issue here when I 
was still on supervised release. Does the facts and the evidence warrant my early 
termination of supervised release? It is up to you to decide what you want to do after 
investigating the evidence and my claims in this letter. If you need any further evidence, 
feel free to contact me, my mother Roberta Hill, and my grandparents Stella and 
Kenneth Forinash. We all saw the discovery papers before they were destroyed by the 
U.S. Attorney. We cannot unsee what we saw.  The download dates, all the weird 
abnormalities in the forensic report. I would have been found not guilty had I been given
better representation but us poor folks do not get access to adequate representation.

One more thing why Jason McMurray had treated me like a human being during 
his supervision of myself. He knew I filed a Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) lawsuit
over my discovery materials in my criminal case. Then Judge Kiser basically insinuated 
in my opinion that I had no right to all of my discovery materials. Jason told me I had a 
right to my federal discovery materials. I filed a 2255 motion over actual innocence, and
it was denied without an evidentiary hearing, and no right to discovery. Every-time I 
have tried to ask for the forensic report, I am denied, or even told I need a court order of 
competent jurisdiction. Just like the body-camera footage, evidence was covered up 
again. Jason McMurray knew all of that which was why he treated me as a human being 
rather than a slave. He knew I stood by what I said and always did what I can to comply 
with my supervised release conditions. I think Jason would be favorable to early 
termination, as Haylea Workman barely knows me and has already altered my 
supervision quite a bit away from Jason's supervision style. I feel that it is unwarranted 
for Haylea Workman to have my supervised release to be quickly and abruptly changed 
out of the blue and devices already approved by Jason were unapproved by Workman. I 
feel like early termination will protect my Constitutional rights from being infringed 
upon by Haylea Workman. Especially preparing legal documents with the court.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on May 13, 2024.

Brian David Hill
310 Forest Street,

Apartment 2
Martinsville, VA 24112

(276) 790-3505
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